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Hanh notes, “Don’t do any task in order to get it over with.  Resolve to do 
each job in a relaxed way, with all your attention.  Enjoy and be one with 
your work.”6 

The benefits of mindfulness are well established.  Mindfulness has been 
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There are numerous writings touting the advantages mindfulness may 
impart on mediators, the parties, and the process of mediation itself.18  
Mindfulness is seen as particularly effective for helping the mediator be 
impartial and avoid implicit bias.19  In this article, I share my personal 
mediation practice and how I incorporate mindfulness to such a degree that I 
think of my mediations as being meditations.  One of the mediation field’s 
greatest challenges is our lack of universally accepted or differentiated 
practices and norms;20 and this article is not intended to be prescriptive or 
address those differences. 

I. MINDFUL MEDIATION BEGINS WITH THE MEDIATOR’S INTENT 
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volunteer rejection forced me to think deeply about my weaknesses and to 
focus on learning how to actually facilitate a conversation. 

I improved dramatically once I understood that mediation begins with 
the mediator’s intent.  With settlement as my goal, I viewed the parties’ 
statements through a lens used to evaluate and determine what would lead 
them towards my objective.  Not everyone who attends mediation knows they 
want to settle, believes settlement is possible, or even trusts the mediator to 
be an impartial facilitator of a process that will result in settlement.  I learned 
that settlement is not the goal o
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to train thousands of mediators.  For me and the students I train, impartiality 
means the mediator does not state their opinion, provide suggestions, 
evaluate the merits of the situation, tell anyone what to do, or pressure 
settlement.  If I am listening to evaluate or judge, my mind will problem-
solve, and I will not be present with what they are actually saying.  I must be 
present, moment to moment during a mediation.  Monitoring my thoughts 
during a mediation session since became an essential part of being an 
effective mediator.22  My mediation practice developed directly as a result of 
my mindfulness practice.  Meditation is what enables me to be a mediator as 
mediation begins with the mediator’s intent. 

II. THE FIVE MEDITATIONS 

There are five meditation modes that support my mediation practice.  
First, I have a mindfulness practice that includes both a daily sitting 
meditation focused on the breath and a twice-daily transcendental meditation 
in which I focus on a mantra.23  I am inspired by Thich Nhat Hanh’s 
accessible form of mindfulness and have previously attended his mindfulness 
retreats.24  Second, I meditate prior to every mediation.  I arrive early to the 
site of the mediation and I like to set up the room and then sit quietly for a 
few minutes.  I always end my mindfulness session by putting myself at a 
specific point in the mediation where I can imagine myself feeling pressure.  
Sometimes, I imagine myself struggling to ask the right question, to help the 
participants feel heard, to deal with the parties’ anger, or to deal with my own 
opinions and judgments that arise at the table.  I find that by putting myself 
in that place in my mind and breathing deeply, I am able to relax and “see” 
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prior to or after a caucus, I like to take 30 seconds to focus on my breathing 
and re-center myself while reminding myself of my role in the mediation. 

As a fourth mode, and fundamental to my mediation style, I am actually 
meditating while I mediate.  So far, I have mainly discussed internal 
mindfulness; being aware of what is going within me as a way to monitor my 
impartiality.26  I also focus on creating an awareness of what is happening 
around me.  In this way I am using both internal and external forms of 
mindfulness.27
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phrase such as “it sounds like,” “you feel,” “for you,” “I’m hearing,” and 
many others as I may be misunderstanding, and this protects my impartiality.  
I reflect, “You feel Jane has always been a great mother,” while glancing at 
Jane to make sure she heard what was said.  I would continue, “but it’s 
important for you to be included in decision-
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can then stop, and someone will fill the gap in the silence.  Or I can address 
the underlying assumptions of the statement, assumptions I would not be able 
to see unless I were present and mindfully prepared to reflect. 

There are multiple assumptions within James’s statement; first, that Bill 
understood the contract.  Second, that Bill and James have the same 
understanding of the contract.  Third, that it was simple for Bill to follow the 
contract.  Finally, there is an assumption that understanding the contract 
would lead to following it.  This is a communication knot similar to that large 
ball of tangled computer wires and electronic cords that we all have in a box 
or drawer somewhere in our homes.  The mediator’s job is to untie the knot 
by facilitating the conversation.  These assumptions are all James’s unasked 
questions, unasked because they are phrased less than directly in the form of 
accusations that are not always easy for Bill to hear or understand.  After my 
reflection I can ask Bill, “Tell us more about your understanding of the 
contract,” or “What are your thoughts about how the contract was followed,” 
or “Why did this happen from your perspective,” or “How did the execution 
of the contract look from your perspective?”  Or I can first ask James 
questions that will likely help Bill to understand his concerns: “Say more 
about why you feel Bill understood the contract’s parameters,” or “Can you 
tell us what following the parameters of the contract would have looked like 
to you?”  In this way, questioning is like that bundle of cords and I am picking 
one and following it by choosing a question from my reflection.  Their 
answers will indicate to me what is important to them and I can continue to 
reflect, expand information and move in whatever area they would like.  
Mediation is a process, but it is not necessarily linear or done in a straight 
line. 

I use questioning to move the conversation forward by untying the knots 
and helping to restore constructive interaction.  To do so, I stay present by 
focusing on the reflection. It is the “breath” of my mediation meditation.  
Reflection also allows me to see the interests in a party’s statement.  This 
helps to amplify their view and helps the speaker and the other side to better 
understand the statement’s meaning. 

With James’s original statement above, I might reflect as I originally did, 
“So for you, the contract is clear, and you feel Bill understood it’s parameters.  
For you, this is about follow-through and you’re not sure why that didn’t 
happen.”  I could alternatively state (or add), “For you this is about 
knowledge and responsibility . . . .”  The follow-through on the contract was 
especially important to you.”  This leads us to a place of discussing the true 
issues—why was follow-through, knowledge, and responsibility important, 
and how are the parties’ definitions and expectations varying on these issues. 
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Mediation is not about asking easy or indirect questions.  It’s about 
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different if James had informed him.  Or I may ask James the steps they went 
through when they discovered the error.  I am not trying to determine the 
truth of whether James was informed, and I am not judging the statement as 
unhelpful or irrelevant to them reaching an agreement.  I am interested in the 
communication’s dynamics and the information each side is seeking.  I am 
working to expand information and helping them discuss the issues.  To do 
so begins with my intent to stay present with their communication and I use 
reflection as the impetus to achieve that objective. 

I do not refer to my mediation “practice” as the cases I mediate for 
compensation.  My mediation practice is something I do regularly in order to 
hone my skills and my ability to mediate.  This is about seeing the questions 
and observing the patterns.  Experience can help anyone improve, but it’s 
about perfect practice, not just practice in order to master these skills.  
Mediation is an onion, and there are layers and layers.  If I make a mistake 
in one mediation, it is unlikely to come up in the next mediation.  I will make 
a different mistake in the next mediation and it continues like that on and on.  
Practicing as a mediator is about overcoming failure and being able to 
continuously learn.  My mindfulness practice thus has a final element- the 
fifth meditation takes place as I take the time after each mediation to breathe 
and meditate for a few moments.  I then debrief with my co-mediator, another 
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about . . .” to keep my questions open.  Note how the question can be tailored 
to be closed as to subject.  If I ask closed-ended questions seeking a yes or 
no answer, I will get shorter answers, limiting the depth and breadth of any 
possible reflection.  It is important to keep the questions open ended, and also 
to be willing to ask the simple questions.  The more perfect I try to make the 
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Sometimes those questions are better asked in caucus, depending on how 
much trust has been built in the room. 
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Second, facilitative mediation is not just for parties who want to have an 
interest-based negotiation.  Plenty of my mediations involve positional 
negotiation.  While I can use interests to help people feel heard, to help each 
side determine what they want, to expand the pie with collaborative solutions, 
and to help them make more persuasive offers, it is up to each side how they 
would like to negotiate.  


